From: Teuton, Lesley - E&E Infrastructure Framework [mailto:lesley.teuton@oxfordshire.gov.uk] 
Sent: 14 June 2013 12:40
To: mail@MontpelierEstates.me.uk
Cc: Andrew Lewis; Deadman, Michael - Environment & Economy - Highways & Transport
Subject: FW: UU - Skimmingdish Lane, Bicester (FAO: Kevin Gerring)
I can confirm that the payment of £2,100 has been received today by BACs.
Thank you.
Lesley Teuton (Mrs)
Planning Obligations Officer
Infrastructure Funding
Infrastructure Development|Environment & Economy|Oxfordshire County Council|Speedwell House|Speedwell Street|Oxford|OX1 1NE
Tel: 01865 815557|Email:Lesley.Teuton@oxfordshire.gov.uk 
www.oxfordshire.gov.uk
Save money and paper - do you really need to print this email?
From: Teuton, Lesley - E&E Infrastructure Framework 
Sent: 13 June 2013 08:23
To: 'mail@MontpelierEstates.me.uk'
Cc: 'Andrew.Lewis@Cherwell-DC.gov.uk'; Deadman, Michael - Environment & Economy - Highways & Transport
Subject: RE: UU - Skimmingdish Lane, Bicester (FAO: Kevin Gerring)
Thank you for sending the signed copy of the Unilateral Undertaking (UU).  We would normally not date the UU until we have received the payment, but as you have confirmed in your e-mail that the BACs payment is being made and also the fact that for it to go through our system here at Oxfordshire County Council it could take a further 2 or 3 days for confirmation of receipt of the payment, I am happy to send you a copy of the dated UU (attached) today.  I have also copied Andrew Lewis at Cherwell District Council into this e-mail.
As soon as I receive confirmation from our Corporate Income Team that we have received the BACs payment I will send you confirmation by e-mail which will act as a receipt.
If you require any further information, please do not hesitate to contact me. 
Lesley Teuton (Mrs)
Planning Obligations Officer
Infrastructure Funding
Infrastructure Development|Environment & Economy|Oxfordshire County Council|Speedwell House|Speedwell Street|Oxford|OX1 1NE
Tel: 01865 815557|Email:Lesley.Teuton@oxfordshire.gov.uk 
www.oxfordshire.gov.uk
Save money and paper - do you really need to print this email?
From: Montpelier Estates [mailto:mail@MontpelierEstates.me.uk] 
Sent: 12 June 2013 17:25
To: Teuton, Lesley - E&E Infrastructure Framework
Subject: RE: UU - Skimmingdish Lane, Bicester (FAO: Kevin Gerring)
Dear Mrs Teuton,

Thank you for the UU information and my apologies for not being able to deal with this matter sooner.  I now attach for your attention the completed Planning Obligation by Unilateral Undertaking which has been signed and witnessed.  The £2,100 payment will be transferred to your account by BACS or CHAPS.  I will call you circa 9.30 in the morning to discuss and ensure that all is in order.  

Finally may I request that once the payment is received that you inform Mr Andrew Lewis, The Planning Officer  at Cherwell Planning Council as our application goes before committee tomorrow evening.  His contact details are: telephone (direct line): 01295 221813 and e-mail Andrew.Lewis@Cherwell-DC.gov.uk
Kind regards.

  

Kevin Gerring

From: Teuton, Lesley - E&E Infrastructure Framework [mailto:lesley.teuton@oxfordshire.gov.uk] 
Sent: 11 June 2013 10:09
To: 'mail@MontpelierEstates.me.uk'
Subject: FW: UU - Skimmingdish Lane, Bicester (FAO: Kevin Gerring)
Please find attached a copy of the draft unilateral undertaking together with a letter explaining the next step of the procedure.
Lesley Teuton (Mrs)
Planning Obligations Officer
Infrastructure Funding
Infrastructure Development|Environment & Economy|Oxfordshire County Council|Speedwell House|Speedwell Street|Oxford|OX1 1NE
Tel: 01865 815557|Email:Lesley.Teuton@oxfordshire.gov.uk 
www.oxfordshire.gov.uk
Save money and paper - do you really need to print this email?
From: Montpelier Estates [mailto:mail@MontpelierEstates.me.uk] 
Sent: 10 June 2013 14:34
To: Deadman, Michael - Environment & Economy - Highways & Transport
Subject: UU - Skimmingdish Lane, Bicester
Dear Mr Deadman,

We refer to your e-mail dated 5th June to Andrew Lewis concerning paperwork for the UU.  We attach completed part of UU Data Form as requested.

Yours sincerely,

Kevin Gerring


Montpelier Estates, Middle Barn, Chilton Business Centre, Chilton, Aylesbury, HP18 9LS
E-mail: Mail@MontpelierEstates.me.uk
Web:    www.MontpelierEstates.me.uk
Tel: 01844 203500 Fax: 01844 202134
